

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.
2518 NW 13th Street
Suite 200E
Gainesville, FL 32609
Phone: 352-222-0831
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie
8092 SW 115th Loop
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 260
Date due: 8/16/2007

SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$925.00
New charges: 2,713.16
Payments applied to cases: (987.05)

TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$2,651.11

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
8/06/07	Automatic Trust Transfer		\$987.05
Total payments:			\$987.05

CASE SUMMARY FOR Insurance cancellation	Previous balance:	\$925.00
------------------------------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
-------------	--------------------	-----------------	---------------

No new payments received for this case

Total payments:	\$0.00
------------------------	---------------

Date	Description	Charges	Amount
-------------	--------------------	----------------	---------------

7/16/07	mailing letter for insurance case and attaching original letter as exhibit	0.3 hr	\$15.00
---------	----------------------------------------------------------------------------	--------	---------

KAM

7/16/07	Review Email sent from client, Respond to Email and transfer email to electronic storage in Case Management Software	0.1 hr	25.00
---------	----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------	--------	-------

RWB

Total charges:	\$40.00
-----------------------	----------------

<u>CASE SUMMARY</u>	
Previous balance:	\$925.00
Total charges:	40.00
Total payments:	0.00
TOTAL DUE for this Case:	\$965.00
You have amounts that are past due. Please pay.	

CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel	Previous balance:	\$0.00
-------------------------------	--------------------------	---------------

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
8/06/07	Transfer from trust account		\$987.05
Total payments:			\$987.05

Date	Description	Charges	Amount
6/04/07	Began Copying and Filing of 729 pages of Production Documents so that they may be mailed.	JRC 0.7 hr	70.00
6/05/07	Pages of Production Documents that were copied.	JRC 729 @ 0.05 each	36.45
6/05/07	Finished copying and filing 729 pages of Production Documents so that they made be mailed.	JRC 0.5 hr	50.00
7/02/07	Copies	JRC 132 @ 0.05 each	6.60
7/02/07	Prepare for hearing on Amended Motion for Sanctions Pursuant to Section 57.105(1) and Motion for Order to Show Cause why Plaintiff Should not be Held in Contempt of Court before the Honorable James Barton, Tampa	RWB 3.9 hrs	975.00
7/03/07	Travel to and Attending Hearing on Amended Motion for Sanctions Pursuant to Section 57.105(1) and Motion for Order to Show Cause why Plaintiff Should not be Held in Contempt of Court - Honorable James Barton, Tampa. Return travel.	RWB 5 hrs	1,250.00
7/03/07	Mileage to Tampa and return	RWB 266 @ 0.49 each	130.34
7/05/07	Copy of a message. Type: Phone Priority: Normal From: Gillespie, Neil Reference: Libel Gillespie, Neil Subject: call him first thing in the morning Phone: Cell: 352-502-8409 Message: wants to know about the hearing -----Return Call and discuss hearing.	JRC 0.1 hr	25.00
7/06/07	Signing up for JCalendar to schedule hearing on motion to withdraw voluntary dismissal. waiting for approval from attorney.	KAM 0.3 hr	22.50

7/27/07	Review 57.105 order. Task assistant to copy client.		0.1 hr	25.00
		RWB		
8/06/07	Postage		2 @ 0.41 each	0.82
		KAM		
8/06/07	Postage		1 @ 8.95 each	8.95
		KAM		

Total charges:	\$2,600.66
-----------------------	-------------------

<u>CASE SUMMARY</u>	
Previous balance:	\$0.00
Total charges:	2,600.66
Total payments:	(987.05)
<hr/>	
TOTAL DUE for this Case:	\$1,613.61

TRUST ACCOUNT

Previous balance: \$987.05

Trust Deposits

Date	Description	Amount
	No new Trust deposits	\$0.00

Trust Withdrawals

Date	Description	Amount
8/06/07	Automatic Trust Transfer	\$987.05

Trust Balance:	\$0.00
-----------------------	---------------

CASE SUMMARY FOR Medical Malpractice	Previous balance:	\$0.00
---------------------------------------------	--------------------------	---------------

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
-------------	--------------------	-----------------	---------------

No new payments received for this case

Total payments:	\$0.00
------------------------	---------------

Date	Description	Charges	Amount
-------------	--------------------	----------------	---------------

7/27/07	Review letter from Mr. Gillispie regarding possible case of medical malpractice. Dictate response.	0.2 hr	50.00
---------	----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------	--------	-------

RWB

8/02/07	Drafting letter from dictation regarding medical malpractice by cardiologist. Printing envelope and presenting to attorney for review.	0.3 hr	22.50
---------	----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------	--------	-------

KAM

Total charges:	\$72.50
-----------------------	----------------

<u>CASE SUMMARY</u>	
Previous balance:	\$0.00
Total charges:	72.50
Total payments:	0.00
<hr/>	
TOTAL DUE for this Case:	\$72.50