

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.
2518 NW 13th Street
Suite 200E
Gainesville, FL 32609
Phone: 352-375-5960
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie
8092 SW 115th Loop
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 736
Date due: 3/16/2008

SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$547.05

New charges: 258.49

Payments applied to cases: (547.05)

TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$258.49

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
2/19/08	Payment received. Thank You!		\$547.05
Total payments:			\$547.05

CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel**Previous balance: \$547.05**

		Payments	
Date	Description		Amount
2/19/08	Payment received. Thank You!		\$547.05
Total payments:			\$547.05

		Charges	
Date	Description		Amount
2/11/08	Adding Denied Petition to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	\$7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
2/11/08	Postage	1 @ 0.58 each	0.58
	NDR		
2/12/08	Reviewing e-mail from law clerk in regards to Response to Petition for Writ of Certorari. E-mailing copy of such to law clerk.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
2/13/08	Making copy of Denial of Petition, processing for mailing, adding to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
2/13/08	Postage	1 @ 0.41 each	0.41
	NDR		
2/14/08	Review correspondence and emails from client regarding status of case. Telephone call to Mr. Gillispie to discuss status of case.	0.3 hr	75.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
2/19/08	Updating client's pleading index file. Filing client documents and pleadings.	0.4 hr	30.00
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
2/25/08	Reviewed e-mails from client in regards to time when he would be available to come in to review pleadings. E-mailed response.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
2/27/08	Making copies of client pleadings, correspondence, and cd for client records.	0.3 hr	22.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/03/08	Filing client documents and pleadings	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/04/08	Contacted potential leads for expert witness	0.2 hr	10.00
	CNP \$50.00 /hr.		
3/05/08	Research for expert witness	0.8 hr	60.00
	CNP \$75.00 /hr.		

3/05/08 Review client's e-mail in regards to copies and setting meeting with attorney before hearing. E-mailed response to client addressing such. 0.2 hr 15.00

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

3/05/08 Review e-mail from client in regards to setting meeting and reviewing pleadings. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

Total charges:	\$258.49
-----------------------	-----------------

CASE SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$547.05

Total charges: 258.49

Total payments: (547.05)

TOTAL DUE for this Case: \$258.49