

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.  
2518 NW 13th Street  
Suite 200E  
Gainesville, FL 32609  
Phone: 352-375-5960  
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie  
8092 SW 115th Loop  
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 810  
Date due: 4/10/2008

**SUMMARY**

Previous balance: \$258.49

New charges: 2,005.39

Payments applied to cases: 0.00

---

**TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$2,263.88**

**CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel  
05CA007205**

**Previous balance: \$258.49**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Payments</b>	<b>Amount</b>
-------------	--------------------	-----------------	---------------

No new payments received for this case

**Total payments: \$0.00**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Charges</b>	<b>Amount</b>
-------------	--------------------	----------------	---------------

3/06/08	Assisted staff with acquisition of expert witness for hearing on attorney fees	JAC \$100.00 /hr.	0.1 hr \$10.00
3/07/08	Conferenced with staff regarding expert witness status	JAC \$100.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 10.00
3/07/08	Telephone call to opposing counsel in regards to hearing on attorney's fees.	NDR \$75.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 7.50
3/07/08	Review client's e-mail regarding meeting with attorney, hearing, and speaking with bookkeeper.	NDR \$75.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 7.50
3/07/08	Telephone call to Mr. Rodems in regards to obtaining a copy of the Notice of Hearing.	NDR \$75.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 7.50
3/10/08	Scanning the copy of the Notice of Hearing, adding it to client's electronic file, e-mailing client a response to his e-mail.	NDR \$75.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 7.50
3/10/08	Review client's e-mail, e-mail response, and calendar meeting for March 17th.	NDR \$75.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 7.50
3/10/08	Calendared Notice of Evidentiary Hearing on Attorney's Fees. Printed directions to courthouse for attorney.	NDR \$50.00 /hr.	0.1 hr 5.00
3/12/08	Telephone call from potential expert witness.	RWB \$250.00 /hr.	0.25 hr 62.50
3/14/08	Spoke with possible expert witness on phone, conferenced with staff regarding progress, emailed possible expert and cc: Senior Attorney on email providing details on hearing and context, reviewed case file to reference opposing counsel's affidavit and discovery dispute.	JAC \$100.00 /hr.	0.5 hr 50.00

3/17/08	Researched pro se litigate entitlement to attorney fees, researched 57.105 entitlement to attorney fees under self-represented counsel, research application of "American Rule," researched public policy considerations for attorney fee award, Contacted an additional 9 firms, emailed 4 firms expressing interest, follow up email and phone calls with two of the 4 who responded to emails, Final outgoing email to Frank Gassler, P.A. in Tampa confirming conversation and willingness to review case.	2.6 hrs	260.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/17/08	Meeting with client to discuss hearing scheduled for March 20th.	0.5 hr	125.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/18/08	Drafted motion for continuance, conferenced with Senior Attorney	0.4 hr	40.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/18/08	three calls with expert witness, filed documents, typed cover letter and faxed over fee listings, and Conferenced with Senior Attorney	0.3 hr	30.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/18/08	Filing client documents and pleadings	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/18/08	Drafting Order Granting Motion for Continuance, drafting cover letter to Judge Barton and opposing, drafting fax cover sheet, and faxing.	0.2 hr	15.00
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/18/08	Telephone call from Judge Barton's Judicial Assistant in regards to received Motion. Informed me that Motion would not be ruled on without a hearing. Telephone call to Mr. Rodems' office to coordinate hearing. Mr. Rodems was unavailable. Telephone call to JA in regards to opposing's unavailability. Left message. Drafted letter in regards to how to proceed if Mr. Rodems is unavailable, drafting fax cover, and faxing.	0.9 hr	67.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/19/08	Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding motion for continuance.	0.1 hr	10.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/19/08	Filing client documents and pleadings	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/19/08	Postage	4 @ 0.41 each	1.64
	NDR		
3/19/08	Postage	1 @ 0.58 each	0.58
	NDR		
3/19/08	Making envelopes for conforming in order to file Motion for Continuance, processing for mailing and adding to client's correspondence log.	0.2 hr	15.00

	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/20/08	Researched, retrieved, and submitted details surround expert witness for hearing on motion for continuance.	0.1 hr	10.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/20/08	Assisted Senior Attorney with hearing preparation	0.1 hr	10.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/20/08	Preparation for hearing, attendance at hearing, and travel time.	3 hrs	750.00
	NDR \$250.00 /hr.		
3/20/08	Mileage to and from Hillsborough County Courthouse.	266 @ 0.59 each	156.94
	RWB		
3/21/08	Organize and Review incoming correspondence, documents, and pleadings.	0.1 hr	10.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
3/21/08	Adding Defendants' Response to Motion for Continuance to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/21/08	Email Mr. Gassler regarding non - need for expert due to not receiving continuance.	0.1 hr	25.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/24/08	Making copies of Defendants' Response to Motion for Continuance, processing for mailing to client, and adding to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/24/08	Filing client documents and pleadings	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/24/08	Postage	1 @ 0.41 each	0.41
	NDR		
3/24/08	Review Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Continuance.	0.25 hr	62.50
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/25/08	Drafting Notice of Unavailability.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/25/08	Making copies of Notice of Unavailability, processing for mailing, and adding to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/25/08	Postage	1 @ 0.41 each	0.41
	NDR		
3/25/08	Review and sign Notice of Unavailability.	0.1 hr	25.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/25/08	Receive and review proposed Final Order and Final Judgment for attorneys fees. Respond.	0.2 hr	50.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/26/08	Preparing Unavailability Notices and envelopes	0.1 hr	7.50
	CNP \$75.00 /hr.		

3/26/08	Adding Order Denying Plaintiff's Motion for Continuance to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/27/08	Adding Proposed Order and Final Judgment to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/27/08	Making copies of Order Denying Plaintiff's Motion for Continuance, processing for mailing, and adding to client's correspondence.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
3/27/08	Postage	1 @ 0.41 each	0.41
	NDR		
3/27/08	Receive and review Court's Order Denying Motion for Continuance.	0.1 hr	25.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/27/08	Telephone call to Mr. Gillispie to discuss outcome of the case.	0.2 hr	50.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
3/31/08	Adding Final Judgment and Order Determining Amount of Sanctions from Judge Barton to client's correspondence log.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		

<b>Total charges:</b>	<b>\$2,005.39</b>
-----------------------	-------------------

<b><u>CASE SUMMARY</u></b>	
Previous balance:	\$258.49
Total charges:	2,005.39
Total payments:	0.00
<hr/>	
<b>TOTAL DUE for this Case:</b>	<b>\$2,263.88</b>
You have amounts that are past due. Please pay.	