

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.
2518 NW 13th Street
Suite 200E
Gainesville, FL 32609
Phone: 352-375-5960
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie
8092 SW 115th Loop
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 893
Date due: 5/11/2008

SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$2,263.88

New charges: 1,165.91

Payments applied to cases: 0.00

TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$3,429.79

CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel
05CA007205 - 060703

Previous balance: \$2,263.88

		Payments		
Date	Description		Amount	

No new payments received for this case

Total payments:	\$0.00
------------------------	---------------

		Charges		
Date	Description		Amount	

4/01/08	Filing client documents and pleadings		0.1 hr	\$7.50
		NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
4/02/08	Meeting with senior attorney to discuss research related to client's right to appeal.		0.2 hr	20.00
		DMS \$100.00 /hr.		
4/02/08	Making copies of letter regarding representation agreement, the representation agreement itself, and Mr. Rodem's Proposed Order and Final Judgment, processing for mailing, and adding to client's correspondence log.		0.2 hr	15.00
		NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
4/02/08	Postage		1 @ 0.41 each	0.41
		NDR		
4/02/08	Recieve and review Proposed Order for Award of Attorney's fees.		0.1 hr	25.00
		RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
4/09/08	Reviewed recent correspondence and pleadings, conferenced with Senior Attorney, initiated draft of response letter to client regarding concerns		0.65 hr	65.00
		JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
4/10/08	Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding pleading recent correspondance and response letter		0.1 hr	10.00
		JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
4/10/08	Finalized review of recent correspondence and case status, completed and revised drafted response to client letter and corresponding documents,		0.95 hr	95.00
		JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
4/11/08	Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding client status, read and revised correspondence to client.		0.55 hr	55.00
		JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
4/11/08	Adding letter regarding copy of discovery to client's correspondence log.		0.1 hr	7.50
		NDR \$75.00 /hr.		

4/16/08	Filing client documents, pleadings, and organizing client's file.	0.2 hr	15.00
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
4/17/08	Telephone call from client in regards to Final Judgment entered into the Court Record. Discussed with client opposing's proposed Order and Final Judgment and indicated that the attorney would have to respond questions as to why the docket indicates that the case will be closed. Brought it to the attorney's attention.	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
4/17/08	Filing client documents and pleadings	0.1 hr	7.50
	NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
4/18/08	Review issue of final judgment being filed. Telephone call to client - extensive discussion discussing status of case and advised client that I would not file an appeal on his behalf regarding the award of attorney's fees.	0.8 hr	200.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
4/19/08	Locate email from opposing counsel and forward discovery to Mr. Gillespie	0.1 hr	25.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
4/21/08	Filing correspondence in client file	0.1 hr	7.50
	CNP \$75.00 /hr.		
4/23/08	Unrecorded telephone call from Mr. Gillespie. He wanted to verify that we received his fax re: copies of documents. I informed him that Mr. Bauer was in meetings all day, but that he would call as soon as possible.	0.1 hr	7.50
	BEL \$75.00 /hr.		
4/24/08	Assisted legal assistant (ndr) and senior law clerk (jac) with client's question concerning a Rule 57.105 Motion.	0.1 hr	10.00
	DMS \$100.00 /hr.		
4/24/08	Meeting with Mr. Gillespie and senior law clerk (jac) to discuss a 57.105 Motion that Mr. Gillespie had a question about.	0.3 hr	30.00
	DMS \$100.00 /hr.		
4/24/08	Met with client regarding: case incorrectly closing, correspondence and responses to inquiries, Mr. Rodems motion and emails toward Senior Attorney on 57.105, Constitutional issues and appeal requirements, breach of fiduciary duty and filing an amended complaint ACLU involvement, and Defamation contrasted with opposing counsels public record; reviewed correspondence and log, assisted staff with copies.	0.45 hr	45.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
4/24/08	Researched requirements and procedure for filing appeal of circuit court in appropriate DCA, typed list of questions and concerns regarding case status, emailed client rules regarding appellate review, and called	0.6 hr	60.00

Senior Attorney regarding appeal.

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

4/24/08 Conferenced and assisted staff with client discrepancies and concerns, reviewed docket and case files regarding 57.105s. 0.5 hr 50.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

4/24/08 Telephone call from client regarding obtaining copies of Writ of Certiorari and Motion for 57.105. Expressed concerns over the filings of 57.105. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/24/08 Making copies of Writ of Certiorari and transcript of hearing on Motion 57.105. Consulting with senior law clerk JAC regarding Mr. Gillespie's concerns. 0.5 hr 37.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/24/08 Copies 30 @ 0.10 each 3.00

NDR

4/24/08 Telephone call from Mr. Gillespie in order to set a meeting with attorney and speak to Mr. Cossey. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/25/08 Conferenced with Senior attorney regarding appeal, reviewed email from client and documented it in electronic log, forwarded email to Senior Attorney for review, sent repond email to client, reviewed requirements for notice of appeal, initiated draft of Notice of Appeal, assisted staff with copying and forwarding of notice of appeal and final judgment. 0.75 hr 75.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

4/25/08 Scanning Notice of Appeal and Final Judgment. E-mailing to client. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/25/08 Review multiple emails from client. Responded to client regarding ACLU email. 0.2 hr 50.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

4/25/08 Office consult regarding appeal with Senior Law Clerk JAC. Receive and review e-mail forwarded from JAC. 0.2 hr 50.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

4/28/08 Adding Notie of Appeal to client's correspondence log. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/30/08 Reviewing e-mail from Mr. Rodem's secretary. Determining Mr. Bauer's availability on the dates provided by JA. Responding to e-mail with dates. 0.2 hr 15.00

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

4/30/08 Telephone call to client. Discuss pending issue status of case and representing on appeal. Discuss other motions for cases. 0.5 hr 125.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

5/01/08 Review e-mail from Mr. Rodem's assistant confirming hearing date for Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

5/01/08 Calendaring hearing on Judgment on Pleadings.
Calculating attorney's travel time to courthouse.

0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

Total charges: \$1,165.91

CASE SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$2,263.88

Total charges: 1,165.91

Total payments: 0.00

TOTAL DUE for this Case: \$3,429.79

You have amounts that are past due. Please pay.