

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.
2518 NW 13th Street
Suite 200E
Gainesville, FL 32609
Phone: 352-375-5960
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie
8092 SW 115th Loop
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 959
Date due: 6/07/2008

SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$3,429.79

New charges: 2,020.00

Payments applied to cases: 0.00

TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$5,449.79

**CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel
05CA007205 - 060703**

Previous balance: \$3,429.79

| Date | Description | Payments | Amount |
|-------------|--------------------|-----------------|---------------|
|-------------|--------------------|-----------------|---------------|

No new payments received for this case

| | |
|------------------------|---------------|
| Total payments: | \$0.00 |
|------------------------|---------------|

| Date | Description | Charges | Amount |
|-------------|--------------------|----------------|---------------|
|-------------|--------------------|----------------|---------------|

| | | | | |
|---------|--|-------------------|--------|--------|
| 5/05/08 | Filing notes in client file | | 0.1 hr | \$7.50 |
| | | JAC \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/05/08 | Filing documents in client file | | 0.2 hr | 15.00 |
| | | JED \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/05/08 | Filing pleadings in client file | | 0.2 hr | 15.00 |
| | | JED \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/05/08 | Adding Defendants' Notice of Hearing to client's correspondence log. | | 0.1 hr | 7.50 |
| | | NDR \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/05/08 | Receive and review mailed Notice of Appeal dated April 25, 2008. | | 0.1 hr | 25.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/05/08 | Receive and review mailed Notice of Hearing dated May 1, 2008. | | 0.1 hr | 25.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/06/08 | Making new labels for pleading file. | | 0.2 hr | 15.00 |
| | | NDR \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/12/08 | filed correspondence, notice of appeal, defendants' notice of hearing, organized 11 of 11 pleadings spindle. | | 0.3 hr | 22.50 |
| | | JED \$75.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/13/08 | Consult with RWB about appellate brief | | 0.1 hr | 10.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/13/08 | Reviewed client documents in preparation for drafting brief | | 2 hrs | 200.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/13/08 | Office consult regarding status of case with Law Clerk AGB. Discussed appellate brief. | | 0.1 hr | 25.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/14/08 | Reviewed client pleadings in preparation to write appellate brief | | 2 hrs | 200.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | | |
| 5/14/08 | Researching appellate procedure to determine timeline | | 0.4 hr | 40.00 |

| | | | |
|---------|---|-------------------|----------------|
| | for filing of appeal | | |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/15/08 | Review of July 3, 2007 trial transcript | | 0.2 hr 20.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/15/08 | Legal research in preparation for appellate brief. | | 3 hrs 300.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/16/08 | Legal research in preparation for writing appellate brief | | 2 hrs 200.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/19/08 | Review of trial transcripts, gathered all available trial transcripts. E-mailed client to see if he was in possession of any other transcripts. Drafted a notice of filing the transcripts. | | 2.5 hrs 250.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/19/08 | Legal research in preparation for appellate brief. | | 0.5 hr 50.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/19/08 | Office consult regarding status of case with Law Clerk AGB. Task drafting of Motion for Relief from Judgment due to mistake. | | 0.1 hr 25.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | E-mail to client in regards to trial transcripts | | 0.1 hr 10.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Legal research in preparation for appellate brief. | | 0.5 hr 50.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding mtn for contempt, conferenced with staff (AGB) regarding appeal, R&R motion for contempt from opposing, initiated motion for stay. | | 0.65 hr 65.00 |
| | | JAC \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Adding letter from client with documents from Second District Court of Appeals and Defendant's Motion for an Order Finding Plaintiff in Contempt of Court. | | 0.1 hr 7.50 |
| | | NDR \$75.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Telephone call from Mr. Rodems' office in regards to setting hearing for Motion for an Order Finding Plaintiff in Contempt. | | 0.1 hr 7.50 |
| | | NDR \$75.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Review Motion for Order finding Plaintiff in contempt of court. Task Senior Law Clerk JAC to draft stay. | | 0.2 hr 50.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | |
| 5/21/08 | Office consult regarding status of case with Senior Law Clerk. Discussed stay and financial form. | | 0.1 hr 25.00 |
| | | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | |
| 5/22/08 | Legal research in preparation for appellate brief | | 0.7 hr 70.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/22/08 | Began drafting appellate brief | | 1 hr 100.00 |
| | | AGB \$100.00 /hr. | |

| | | | | |
|---------|---|-----|---------------|--------|
| 5/22/08 | Edited, reviewed, and submitted motion for stay to Senior Attorney. | | 0.15 hr | 15.00 |
| | | JAC | \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/23/08 | Drafting appellate brief | | 1.5 hrs | 150.00 |
| | | AGB | \$100.00 /hr. | |
| 5/23/08 | Adding Transcript of the hearing for March 20, 2008 to client's correspondence log. | | 0.1 hr | 7.50 |
| | | NDR | \$75.00 /hr. | |
| 5/28/08 | filed pleadings and correspondence in client folder. | | 0.2 hr | 10.00 |
| | | JED | \$50.00 /hr. | |

| | |
|-----------------------|-------------------|
| Total charges: | \$2,020.00 |
|-----------------------|-------------------|

| <u>CASE SUMMARY</u> | |
|---|-------------------|
| Previous balance: | \$3,429.79 |
| Total charges: | 2,020.00 |
| Total payments: | 0.00 |
| <hr/> | |
| TOTAL DUE for this Case: | \$5,449.79 |
| You have amounts that are past due. Please pay. | |