

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.
2815 NW 13th Street
Suite 200E
Gainesville, FL 32609
Phone: 352-375-5960
Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie
8092 SW 115th Loop
Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 1030
Date due: 7/10/2008

SUMMARY

Previous balance: \$5,449.79

New charges: 2,557.48

Payments applied to cases: 0.00

TOTAL DUE FOR ALL CASES: \$8,007.27

CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel
05CA007205 - 060703

Previous balance: \$5,449.79

Date	Description	Payments	Amount
-------------	--------------------	-----------------	---------------

No new payments received for this case

Total payments: \$0.00

Date	Description	Charges	Amount
-------------	--------------------	----------------	---------------

5/29/08 Telephone call from Mr. Rodems' office in regards to having Motion to find Plaintiff in Contempt of Court heard on July 1. 0.1 hr \$5.00

NDR \$50.00 /hr.

5/30/08 Completed first draft of appellate argument, began editing draft. 3.5 hrs 350.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/02/08 Edited drafts of appellate argument. 2 hrs 200.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/02/08 Consult with RWB concerning additional issues to include and research to be conducted related to appellate brief. 0.1 hr 10.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/02/08 Additional legal research for appellate brief. 1 hr 100.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/05/08 Re-draft of appellate argument. 0.6 hr 60.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/05/08 Adding ACLU letter declining representation to client's correspondence log. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

6/06/08 Editing and redrafting appellate argument. 1 hr 100.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/06/08 Adding Defendant's Amended Notice of Hearing to client's correspondence log. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

6/09/08 Edited appellate argument. 0.2 hr 20.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/09/08 Consult with RWB concerning record for appellate brief. Contacted Hillsborough County Clerk's office regarding status of record. Drafted Motion for Extension of Time and Notice of Filing Transcripts. 1.5 hrs 150.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

6/09/08 Copies - 12 1.20

	AGB		
6/09/08	Postage - 2 first class letters		0.84
	AGB		
6/09/08	Fed Ex Fee		17.68
	BEL		
6/09/08	Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding Motion for Stay	0.1 hr	10.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
6/09/08	Consult with JAC regarding Motion for Stay.	0.1 hr	25.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
6/09/08	Review Initial Brief draft and determine status of record. Clerk of court has not forwarded record pursuant to rules and contact opposing requesting consent to continuance.	0.5 hr	125.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
6/09/08	Review of Motion for Extension of Time.	0.1 hr	17.50
	TMU \$175.00 /hr.		
6/10/08	Preparing transcripts for filing.	0.1 hr	5.00
	AGB \$50.00 /hr.		
6/10/08	Preparing Directions for Clerk.	1.2 hrs	120.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/10/08	232 copies of trial transcripts to submit to the Clerk of Court of Hillsborough County		23.20
	AGB		
6/11/08	E-mail to RWB about Directions to Clerk.	0.1 hr	10.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	Preparing Directions for Clerk for how to compile the record for the appellate brief.	1 hr	100.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	E-mail to RWB about Directions to Clerk.	0.1 hr	10.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	Revision of Directions to Clerk per RWB's instruction	0.4 hr	40.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	Consult with JAC regarding brief arguments.	0.2 hr	20.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	Conferenced with staff (AGB) regarding brief arguments.	0.2 hr	20.00
	JAC \$100.00 /hr.		
6/12/08	Review Notice to Clerk and request changes for Law Clerk (AGB) to make.	0.2 hr	50.00
	RWB \$250.00 /hr.		
6/13/08	Revision of Directions to Clerk	0.5 hr	50.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/13/08	Revision of appellate brief.	2 hrs	200.00
	AGB \$100.00 /hr.		

6/16/08	Fed Ex			27.06
		BEL		
6/17/08	Downloaded and printed Florida Rule of Appellate Procedure 9.210 in preparation for drafting the other components of the appellate brief.		0.1 hr	10.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/18/08	Review of e-mail from court reporter.		0.1 hr	10.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/19/08	Worked on drafting other components of the brief.		0.5 hr	50.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/20/08	Drafted other components of brief.		2 hrs	200.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/20/08	Researched abuse of discretion standard and definition		0.5 hr	50.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/23/08	Drafting Summary of Argument, Conclusion, checking all formatting of appellate brief.		3 hrs	300.00
		AGB \$100.00 /hr.		
6/23/08	Preparing, sending, and filing Amended Directions to Clerk.		0.6 hr	30.00
		AGB \$50.00 /hr.		
6/25/08	Adding Directions to Clerk from opposing to client's correspondence log.		0.1 hr	7.50
		NDR \$75.00 /hr.		
6/26/08	Filed client pleadings.		0.1 hr	5.00
		AGB \$50.00 /hr.		
6/26/08	File maintenance.		0.1 hr	5.00
		DMS \$50.00 /hr.		
6/27/08	Adding Invoice and Appellate Case Records to client's correspondence log.		0.1 hr	7.50
		NDR \$75.00 /hr.		

Total charges:	\$2,557.48
-----------------------	-------------------

<u>CASE SUMMARY</u>	
Previous balance:	\$5,449.79
Total charges:	2,557.48
Total payments:	0.00
<hr/>	
TOTAL DUE for this Case:	\$8,007.27
You have amounts that are past due. Please pay.	