

Law Office of Robert W. Bauer, P.A.  
 2815 NW 13th Street  
 Suite 200E  
 Gainesville, FL 32609  
 Phone: 352-375-5960  
 www.Bauerlegal.com Email:

Mr. Neil Gillespie  
 8092 SW 115th Loop  
 Ocala, Florida 34481

Bill Number: 1227  
 Date due: 9/13/2008

## STATEMENT

|                               |                          |                   |
|-------------------------------|--------------------------|-------------------|
| <b>CASE SUMMARY FOR Libel</b> | <b>Previous balance:</b> | <b>\$9,999.71</b> |
| <b>05CA007205 - 060703</b>    |                          |                   |

| Date | Description | Payments | Amount |
|------|-------------|----------|--------|
|------|-------------|----------|--------|

No new payments received for this case

|                        |               |
|------------------------|---------------|
| <b>Total payments:</b> | <b>\$0.00</b> |
|------------------------|---------------|

| Date | Description | Charges | Amount |
|------|-------------|---------|--------|
|------|-------------|---------|--------|

|         |  |                   |                   |
|---------|--|-------------------|-------------------|
| 8/01/08 | Filed client correspondence.   | AGB \$50.00 /hr.  | 0.1 hr = \$5.00   |
| 8/04/08 | Adding Motion for Sanctions Pursuant to section 57.105 regarding Breach of Contract and Motion for Sanctions Pursuant to section 57.105 regarding Motion for Rehearing from Mr. Rodems to client's correspondence log. | NDR \$75.00 /hr.  | 0.1 hr      7.50  |
| 8/06/08 | Review e-mail from opposing discussing problems with Motion for Reconsideration.   | RWB \$250.00 /hr. | 0.2 hr      50.00 |
| 8/07/08 | Filed client correspondence.   | AGB \$50.00 /hr.  | 0.1 hr      5.00  |
| 8/08/08 | Searching through trial transcripts.   |                   | 0.2 hr = \$10.00  |

AGB \$50.00 /hr.

8/11/08 Adding Order to Respond to Motion to Supplement Record to client's correspondendce log. 0.1 hr 7.50

NDR \$75.00 /hr.

8/11/08 Research possible objection to request to supplement the record. No reasonable objection found. 0.2 hr 50.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Review of e-mail from client. 0.1 hr 10.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Sent e-mail to client regarding trial transcripts. 0.1 hr 10.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Filed client correspondence. 0.1 hr 5.00

AGB \$50.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Review of trial transcripts. Sent e-mail to Senior Attorney (RWB) with findings. 0.4 hr 40.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Research to determine the cost, if any, of compiling the record. Sent e-mail to Senior Attorney (RWB) with results. 0.3 hr 30.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

8/12/08 Review of e-mail from client. 0.1 hr 17.50

TMU \$175.00 /hr.

8/13/08 Filed client notes, correspondence, and pleadings. 0.1 hr 5.00

AGB \$50.00 /hr.

8/13/08 Summons Fee 1 @ 20.00 each 20.00

BEL

8/14/08 Filed client correspondence and pleadings. 0.1 hr 5.00

AGB \$50.00 /hr.

8/14/08 Researched writ of garnishment and social security benefits, researched reponsive pleadings, submitted research to Senior Attorney. 0.4 hr 40.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

8/14/08 Submitted email to client regarding Claim of Exemption, Spoke with client regarding email and submitted documents via fax, reveiwed emails from Attorney regarding advisements. Spoke with client and filled out form, left message and sent additional email to Senior Attorney regarding form, redrafted Claim and Request for Hearing, submitted to staff and advised of appropriate submission. 0.6 hr 60.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

8/14/08 Conferenced with Senior Attorney (RWB) regarding vehicle exemption and medical necessity, researched vehicle exemption and items acquired with social security exemption 0.5 hr 50.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

8/14/08 Conferenced with Senior Law Clerk (JAC) regarding 0.1 hr 20.00

vehicle exemption and medical necessity

RWB \$200.00 /hr.

8/15/08 Call to Accredited Surety and Casualty Company to determine application procedure for injunction bond. 0.1 hr 10.00

AGB \$100.00 /hr.

8/19/08 Conferred with Senior Law Clerk (JAC) re: bonds 0.1 hr 0.08

AGB \$0.75 /hr.

8/19/08 Conferenced with Senior Attorney regarding bond status, contacted bond company regarding bond status and discussed payment options, sent email to bond company expressing termination of application. 0.25 hr 25.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

8/19/08 Researched possible bonds, conferenced with staff Law Clerk (AGB), conferenced with Senior Attorney (RWB) , contacted 4 bond companies for best rate and spoke with client to finish application, submitted update to Senior Attorney, and sent email to client with status update. 1.1 hrs 110.00

JAC \$100.00 /hr.

8/19/08 Task Senior Law Clerk (JAC) to obtain bond. 0.1 hr 25.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

8/19/08 Conferenced with Senior Law Clerk (JAC) re: bonds 0.1 hr 25.00

RWB \$250.00 /hr.

8/29/08 Copies 21 @ 0.10 each 2.10

MEG

9/01/08 Review email from client and respond. 0.1 hr 20.00

RWB \$200.00 /hr.

9/02/08 Logging Letter Re: Appellee's Motion to Supplement in Correspondence Log 0.1 hr 5.00

MEG \$50.00 /hr.

**Total charges: \$654.68**

### **CASE SUMMARY**

Previous balance: \$9,999.71

Total charges: 654.68

Total payments: 0.00

---

**TOTAL DUE for this Case: \$10,654.39**

You have amounts that are past due. Please pay.